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GROUP 1 |Galvanized Steel Pipe (21° Lengths) to Include 1 Coupling
SAWS No. 14742 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE N/A 0.80 0.94 5.11
1. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1/8" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 400.00 470.00 2,555.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14741 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 1.18 0.80 0.94 6.608
2. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1/4" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 590.00 400.00 470.00 3,304.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14748 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 1.59 0.80 0.94 7.508
3. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 3/8" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 795.00 400.00 470.00 3,754.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14740 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 0.55 0.80 0.50 1.422
4. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1/2" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 275.00 400.00 250.00 711.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14748 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 0.73 1.05 0.50 1.885
5. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 3/4" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 365.00 525.00 250.00 942.50 NO BID
SAWS No. 14744 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 1.06 1.55 0.95 2.322
6. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 530.00 775.00 475.00 1,161.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14744 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 1.43 2.08 1.24 3.027
7. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1-1/4" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 715.00 1,040.00 620.00 1,513.50 NO BID
SAWS No. 14743 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 1.72 250 1.56 3.635
8. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 1-1/2" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 860.00 1,250.00 780.00 1,817.50 NO BID
SAWS No. 14747 UNIT
500 ft. PRICE 231 3.37 2.00 4.766
9. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 2" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 1,155.00 1,685.00 1,000.00 2,383.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14746 UNIT
300 ft. PRICE 3.67 5.50 3.39 8.267
10. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 2-1/2" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 1,101.00 1,650.00 1,017.00 2,480.10 NO BID
SAWS No. 14750 UNIT
300 ft. PRICE 4.82 7.18 4.12 10.84
11. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 3" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 1,446.00 2,154.00 1,236.00 3,252.00 NO BID
SAWS No. 14751 UNIT
300 ft. PRICE 6.86 10.23 5.76 15.067
12. Pipe Galvanized steel, Size 4" x 21' (Threaded) TOTAL 2,058.00 3,069.00 1,728.00 4,520.10 NO BID
TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 9,890.00 13,748.00 8,766.00 28,393.70 NO BID
Additional sizes and items can be purchased as listed below:
Various Wheatland Matco
Manufacturer Merfish US Pipe Imported Mfrs. Domestic Norca
Price Sheet N/A
Date 3/31/17
Discount Net Price 0%
Standard Galvanized Steel Nipples 153 Type "'F"* or Type "E"
Standard 1/8-8 NPS/6 - 200 DN Right Hand Threads Galvanized
GROUP 2 |BUSHING REDUCER
SAWS No. 10149 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.23 1.01 0.31 0.385 1.35
1. Bushing Hex Reducer Size 1/4" x 1/8" Male x Female Threaded TOTAL 49.20 40.40 12.40 15.40 54.00
SAWS No. 10059 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.23 1.01 0.38 0.473 1.35
2. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 3/8" x 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 73.80 60.60 22.80 28.38 81.00
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SAWS No. 10057 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.41 1.16 0.49 1.192 1.55
3. Bushing, Hex Size 3/4" x 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 84.60 69.60 29.40 71.52 93.00
SAWS No. 10061 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.53 2.08 2.55 6.125 2.75
4. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 50.60 41.60 51.00 122.50 55.00
SAWS No. 10142 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.23 0.71 0.81 0.76 0.93
5. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1/2" x 1/8" Male X Femal Threaded TOTAL 24.60 14.20 16.20 15.22 18.60
SAWS No. 10062 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.23 1.01 1.14 0.761 1.35
6. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1/2" x 1/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 49.20 40.40 45.60 30.44 54.00
SAWS No. 10141 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.27 1.41 0.48 1.192 1.35
7. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 3/4" x 1/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 50.80 56.40 19.20 47.68 54.00
SAWS No. 10121 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.14 0.93 1.12 1.192 1.49
8. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 3/4" x 1/2" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 45.60 37.20 44.80 47.68 59.60
SAWS No. 10104 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 1.37 1.12 1.32 3.507 1.89
9. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1" x 1/2" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 109.60 89.60 105.60 280.56 151.20
SAWS No. 10162 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.29 1.07 1.32 3.265 1.89
10. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1" x 3/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 25.80 21.40 26.40 65.30 37.80
SAWS No. 10126 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.74 1.43 1.71 4.398 273
11. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/4" x 3/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 34.80 28.60 34.20 87.96 54.60
SAWS No. 10125 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.74 1.43 171 4.398 2.73
12. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/4" x 1" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 34.80 28.60 34.20 87.96 54.60
SAWS No. 10124 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.53 2.08 2.36 6.125 2.75
13. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 3/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 50.60 41.60 47.20 122.50 55.00
SAWS No. 10131 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.10 1.73 2.47 5.30 3.19
14. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 1-1/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 42.00 34.60 49.40 106.00 63.80
SAWS No. 10129 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.94 241 2.75 7.135 4.07
15. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 2" x 3/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 58.80 48.20 55.00 142.70 81.40
SAWS No. 10127 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.78 2.28 2.75 7.135 4.07
16. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 2" x 1" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 55.60 45.60 55.00 142.70 81.40
SAWS No. 10136 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 278 2.28 2.75 7.135 4.07
17. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 2" x 1-1/4" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 55.60 45.60 55.00 142.70 81.40
SAWS No. 10128 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 243 2.00 2.39 6.154 3.37
18. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 2" x 1-1/2" Male X Female Threaded TOTAL 97.20 80.00 95.60 246.16 134.80
SAWS No. 10103 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.23 1.01 0.38 0.473 1.35
19. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1/4" x 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 24.60 20.20 7.60 9.46 27.00
SAWS No. 10100 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.23 1.01 1.07 0.761 1.35
20. Bushing, Reducer Size 1/2" x 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 73.80 60.60 64.20 45.66 81.00
SAWS No. 10102 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.27 1.04 0.48 1.192 1.35
21, Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 3/4" x 1/* Threaded TOTAL 25.40 20.80 9.60 23.84 27.00
SAWS No. 10099 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.28 2.15 223 5.533 3.16
22. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 45.60 43.00 44.60 110.66 63.20
SAWS No. 10123 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 11.80 9.71 12.26 27.987 16.33
23. Bushing, Hex Reducer Size 4" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 236.00 194.20 245.20 559.74 326.60
TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 1,398.60 1,163.00 1,170.20 2,552.72 1,790.00
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GROUP 3 |CAP
SAWS No. 10215 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.79 0.65 0.52 0.694 0.86
1. Cap, Size 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 15.80 13.00 10.40 13.88 17.20
SAWS No. 10197 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.81 0.66 0.27 0.458 0.89
2. Cap, Size 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 16.20 13.20 5.40 9.16 17.80
SAWS No. 10194 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.61 0.50 0.56 1.096 0.89
3. Cap, Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 12.20 10.00 11.20 21.92 17.80
SAWS No. 10212 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.88 0.72 1.04 2.326 1.22
4. Cap, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 17.60 14.40 20.80 46.52 24.40
SAWS No. 10191 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.96 0.78 1.05 2.683 1.33
5. Cap, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 19.20 15.60 21.00 53.66 26.60
SAWS No. 10190 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 1.39 1.14 1.95 3.53 1.93
6. Cap, Size 1-1/4" Threaded TOTAL 41.70 34.20 58.50 105.90 57.90
SAWS No. 10189 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.78 1.47 2.25 4528 2.46
7. Cap, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 35.60 29.40 45.00 90.56 49.20
SAWS No. 10207 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 225 1.85 2.20 6.34 3.15
8. Cap, Size 2" Threaded TOTAL 45,00 37.00 44.00 126.80 63.00
TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 203.30 166.80 216.30 468.40 273.90
GROUP 4 [COUPLING
SAWS No. 10897 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.09 0.90 0.99 3.13 1.21
1. Coupling, Size 1/8" Threaded TOTAL 21.80 18.00 19.80 62.60 24.20
SAWS No. 10949 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 1.02 0.84 1.00 2.70 121
2. Coupling, Size 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 20.40 16.80 20.00 54.00 24.20
SAWS No. 10895 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.02 0.84 1.00 2.61 1.21
3. Coupling, Size 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 20.40 16.80 20.00 52.20 24.20
SAWS No. 10886 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.82 0.67 0.78 2.06 1.23
4. Coupling, Reducer Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 16.40 13.40 15.60 41.20 24.60
SAWS No. 10941 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.94 0.77 0.93 2.38 1.25
5. Coupling Reducer, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 18.80 15.40 18.60 47.60 25.00
SAWS No. 10915 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 155 1.93 3.67 3.90 2.16
6. Coupling, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 31.00 38.60 73.40 78.00 43.20
SAWS No. 10902 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.44 2.01 3.25 6.26 337
7. Coupling Reducer, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 48.80 40.20 65.00 125.20 67.40
SAWS No. 10919 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 3.56 2.92 3.48 9.15 4.93
8. Coupling, Size 2" Threaded TOTAL 213.60 175.20 208.80 549.00 295.80
SAWS No. 10934 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 14.52 11.95 14.20 37.43 20.11
9. Coupling, Size 3" Threaded TOTAL 290.40 239.00 284.00 748.60 402.20
TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 681.60 573.40 725.20 1,758.40 930.80
GROUP 5 |COUPLING REDUCER
SAWS No. 11156 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.82 0.67 0.80 2.50 0.99
1. Coupling Reducer, Size 3/8" x 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 16.40 13.40 16.00 50.00 19.80
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SAWS No. 11148 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.88 0.72 0.86 2.41 0.99
2. Coupling Reducer, Size 1/2" x 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 17.60 14.40 17.20 48.20 19.80
SAWS No. 11149 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.59 1.32 1.85 4.469 2.20
3. Coupling Reducer, Size 1/2" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 31.80 26.40 37.00 89.38 44.00
SAWS No. 11158 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.95 2.42 2.93 8.746 4.09
4. Coupling Reducer, Size 1/2" x 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 59.00 48.40 58.60 174.92 81.80
SAWS No. 11150 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.26 3.50 4.87 12.627 461
5. Coupling Reducer, Size 1/2" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 85.20 70.00 97.40 252,54 92.20
SAWS No. 11168 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.96 0.78 0.93 2.68 1.33
6. Coupling, Reducer, Size 3/4" x 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 19.20 15.60 18.60 53.60 26.60
SAWS No. 11145 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.59 1.32 1.60 4.469 2.20
7. Coupling, Reducer Size 1" x 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 31.80 26.40 32.00 89.38 44.00
SAWS No. 11159 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.48 1.22 1.45 4.149 2.20
8. Coupling, Reducer Size 1" x 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 29.60 24.40 29.00 82.98 44.00
SAWS No. 11162 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.61 2.15 2.46 7.45 3.61
9. Coupling, Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 52.20 43.00 49.20 149.00 72.20
SAWS No. 11160 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 261 2.15 2.12 7.45 3.61
10. Coupling, Reducer Size 1-1/2" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 52.20 43.00 42.40 149.00 72.20
SAWS No. 11161 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.47 2.03 2.36 7.038 4.62
11. Coupling, Reducing Size 1-1/2" x 1-1/4" Threaded TOTAL 49.40 40.60 47.20 140.76 92.40
SAWS No. 11167 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.26 3.50 3.64 12.177 463
12. Coupling, Reducer Size 2" x 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 85.20 70.00 72.80 243.54 92.60
SAWS No. 11164 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.56 2.92 3.48 10.166 4.63
13. Coupling, Reducer Size 2" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 71.20 58.40 69.60 203.32 92.60
SAWS No. 11165 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.56 2.92 3.45 10.166 463
14. Coupling, Reducer Size 2" x 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 71.20 58.40 69.00 203.32 92.60
SAWS No. 11154 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 13.82 11.37 13.51 35.627 19.13
15. Coupling, Reducer Size 2" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 276.40 227.40 270.20 712.54 382.60
SAWS No. 11157 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 31.64 26.04 29.59 81.56 43.80
16. Coupling, Reducer Size 3" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 632.80 520.80 591.80 1,631.20 876.00
TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 1,581.20 1,300.60 1,518.00 4,273.68 2,145.40
GROUP 6 [CROSS
SAWS No. 11299 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.92 2.40 3.53 7.526 3.17
1. Cross, Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 58.40 48.00 70.60 150.52 63.40
SAWS No. 11311 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.56 2.93 4.85 9.17 3.86
2. Cross, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 71.20 58.60 97.00 183.40 77.20
SAWS No. 11298 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.92 4.04 6.66 12.653 5.33
3. Cross, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 98.40 80.80 133.20 253.06 106.60
SAWS No. 11303 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 8.63 7.11 9.58 22.254 9.35
4. Cross, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 172.60 142.20 191.60 445.08 187.00
SAWS No. 11297 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 16.47 13.55 17.79 42.152 17.83
5. Cross, Size 2" Threaded TOTAL 329.40 271.00 355.80 843.04 356.60
TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 730.00 600.60 848.20 1,875.10 790.80
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GROUP 7 |ELBOW
SAWS No. 11574 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.92 0.72 0.93 2.40 0.96
1. Elbow, Size 1/8" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 18.40 14.40 18.60 48.00 19.20
SAWS No. 11631 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 117 0.97 1.20 3.34 1.27
2. Elbow, Size 3/8" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 23.40 19.40 24.00 66.80 25.40
SAWS No. 11630 UNIT
40 ea. PRICE 0.88 0.72 0.88 2.19 0.96
3. Elbow, Size 3/8" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 35.20 28.80 35.20 87.60 38.40
SAWS No. 11567 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.18 0.97 121 2.99 1.28
4. Elbow, Size 1/4" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 23.60 19.40 24.20 59.80 25.60
SAWS No. 11566 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.88 0.72 0.88 2.193 1.22
5. Elbow, Size 1/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 17.60 14.40 17.60 43.86 24.40
SAWS No. 11557 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.90 0.74 2.11 2.23 1.24
6. Elbow, Size 1/2" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 18.00 14.80 42.20 44.60 24.80
SAWS No. 11556 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 0.58 0.48 0.59 141 0.81
7. Elbow, Size 1/2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 34.80 28.80 35.40 84.60 48.60
SAWS No. 11617 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.26 1.03 1.29 321 1.74
8. Elbow, Size 3/4" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 25.20 20.60 25.80 64.20 34.80
SAWS No. 11616 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 0.70 0.58 0.71 1.73 0.96
9. Elbow, Size 3/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 56.00 46.40 56.80 138.40 76.80
SAWS No. 11628 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.18 0.97 1.06 3.01 1.29
10. Elbow, Size 3/4" x 1/2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 23.60 19.40 21.20 60.20 25.80
SAWS No. 11555 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.45 1.18 1.49 3.62 1.99
11. Elbow, Size 1" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 29.00 23.60 29.80 72.40 39.80
SAWS No. 11545 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.31 1.08 1.60 321 1.81
12. Elbow, Size 1" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 78.60 64.80 96.00 192.60 108.60
SAWS No. 11547 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.51 1.24 481 3.869 2.86
13. Elbow, Size 1-3/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 30.20 24.80 96.20 77.38 57.20
SAWS No. 11590 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.64 2.16 3.65 6.77 3.66
14. Elbow, Size 1-1/4" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 52.80 43.20 73.00 135.40 73.20
SAWS No. 11591 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.01 1.65 2.99 5.07 3.40
15. Elbow, Size 1-1/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 40.20 33.00 59.80 101.40 68.00
SAWS No. 11580 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.15 259 3.18 7.956 4.36
16. Elbow, Size 1-1/2" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 63.00 51.80 63.60 159.12 87.20
SAWS No. 11579 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.65 2.18 311 6.62 3.67
17. Elbow, Size 1-1/2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 53.00 43.60 62.20 132.40 73.40
SAWS No. 11599 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 4.70 3.86 4.40 11.77 6.50
18. Elbow, Size 2" Threaded Degree 45 TOTAL 94.00 77.20 88.00 235.40 130.00
SAWS No. 11598 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 4.42 3.63 4.44 10.85 6.11
19. Elbow, Size 2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 265.20 217.80 266.40 651.00 366.60
TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 981.80 806.20 1,136.00 2,455.16 1,347.80
GROUP 8 |STREET ELBOW
SAWS No. 11763 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.20 0.99 1.22 3.03 1.34
1. Elbow, Street Size 1/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 24.00 19.80 24.40 60.60 26.80
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SAWS No. 11762 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.24 1.02 1.22 3.10 171
2. Elbow, Street Size 1/2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 24.80 20.40 24.40 62.00 34.20
SAWS No. 11769 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 1.20 0.99 122 3.038 1.67
3. Elbow, Street Size 3/8" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 96.00 79.20 97.60 243.04 133.60
SAWS No. 11768 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 1.20 0.99 1.22 3.10 1.67
4. Elbow, Street Size 3/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 96.00 79.20 97.60 248.00 133.60
SAWS No. 11761 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.64 1.35 1.66 4.149 2.27
5. Elbow, Street Size 1" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 98.40 81.00 99.60 248.94 136.20
SAWS No. 11766 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.76 2.27 2.49 6.975 3.81
6. Elbow, Street Size 1-1/4" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 55.20 45.40 49.80 139.50 76.20
SAWS No. 11765 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.39 2.79 2.98 8.757 4.70
7. Elbow, Street Size 1-1/2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 67.80 55.80 59.60 175.14 94.00
SAWS No. 11767 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 5.88 4.84 5.94 14.559 8.14
8. Elbow, Street Size 2" Threaded Degree 90 TOTAL 352.80 290.40 356.40 873.54 488.40
TOTAL GROUP 8 TOTAL 815.00 671.20 809.40 2,050.76 1,123.00
GROUP 9 |NIPPLE
SAWS No. 13938 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.41 0.43 0.76 1.168 0.59
1. Nipple, Size 1/8" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 8.20 8.60 15.20 23.36 11.80
SAWS No. 13934 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.77 0.58 0.76 1.467 0.77
2. Nipple, Size 1/8" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 15.40 11.60 15.20 29.34 15.40
SAWS No. 13939 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.43 0.32 0.76 0.0795 0.43
3. Nipple, Size 1/8" x Close Threaded TOTAL 8.60 6.40 15.20 1.59 8.60
SAWS No. 14060 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.48 0.37 0.42 1.068 0.57
4. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 9.60 7.40 8.40 21.36 11.40
SAWS No. 14062 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.58 0.42 0.49 1.05 0.76
5. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 11.60 8.40 9.80 21.00 15.20
SAWS No. 14058 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.76 0.57 0.65 1.33 0.90
6. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 7.60 5.70 6.50 13.30 9.00
SAWS No. 14063 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.76 0.57 0.65 1.33 0.90
7. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 22.80 17.10 19.50 39.90 27.00
SAWS No. 14070 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.90 0.67 0.76 1.57 1.23
8. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 18.00 13.40 15.20 31.40 24.60
SAWS No. 14064 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.90 0.67 0.76 157 1.23
9. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 18.00 13.40 15.20 31.40 24.60
SAWS No. 14072 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.25 0.93 1.06 2.17 1.23
10. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 25.00 18.60 21.20 43.40 24.60
SAWS No. 14059 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.25 0.93 1.06 2.17 1.23
11. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 12.50 9.30 10.60 21.70 12.30
SAWS No. 14081 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.37 1.03 1.53 2.41 1.38
12. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 27.40 20.60 30.60 48.20 27.60
SAWS No. 14065 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.37 1.03 153 2.41 1.38
13. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 27.40 20.60 30.60 48.20 27.60
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SAWS No. 14075 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.22 1.65 2.53 3.52 2.18
14. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 7" Threaded TOTAL 22.20 16.50 25.30 35.20 21.80
SAWS No. 14077 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.22 1.65 4.88 4.595 2.18
15. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 8" Threaded TOTAL 22.20 16.50 48.80 45.95 21.80
SAWS No. 14067 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.63 1.97 2.92 4.595 2.61
16. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 10" Threaded TOTAL 26.30 19.70 29.20 45.95 26.10
SAWS No. 14061 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.93 2.18 3.24 5.09 2.88
17. Nipple, Size 3/8" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 29.30 21.80 32.40 50.90 28.80
SAWS No. 14066 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.48 0.37 0.42 0.86 0.49
18. Nipple, Size 3/8" x Close Threaded TOTAL 4.80 3.70 4.20 8.60 4.90
SAWS No. 13914 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.46 0.34 0.42 0.936 0.59
19. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 23.00 17.00 21.00 46.80 29.50
SAWS No. 13915 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.52 0.40 0.46 0.936 0.60
20. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 26.00 20.00 23.00 46.80 30.00
SAWS No. 13923 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.52 0.40 0.46 0.936 0.63
21. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 15.60 12.00 13.80 28.08 18.90
SAWS No. 13928 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.69 0.52 0.62 1.219 0.70
22. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 34.50 26.00 31.00 60.95 35.00
SAWS No. 13916 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.69 0.52 0.70 1.219 0.70
23. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 20.70 15.60 21.00 36.57 21.00
SAWS No. 13924 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.83 0.63 0.77 1.46 0.83
24. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 24.90 18.90 23.10 43.80 24.90
SAWS No. 13917 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 0.83 0.63 0.77 1.46 0.90
25. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 49.80 37.80 46.20 87.60 54.00
SAWS No. 13918 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.15 0.86 0.97 1.98 1.13
26. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 23.00 17.20 19.40 39.60 22.60
SAWS No. 13919 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.15 0.86 1.09 221 1.13
27. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 11.50 8.60 10.90 22.10 11.30
SAWS No. 13920 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.28 0.96 141 2.48 1.26
28. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 12.80 9.60 14.10 24.80 12.60
SAWS No. 13921 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 1.28 0.96 1.53 1.89 1.56
29. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 64.00 48.00 76.50 94.50 78.00
SAWS No. 13932 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.19 1.63 2.41 4.24 2.15
30. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 8" Threaded TOTAL 43.80 32.60 48.20 84.80 43.00
SAWS No. 13925 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.55 1.89 2.81 4.93 2.50
31. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 10" Threaded TOTAL 51.00 37.80 56.20 98.60 50.00
SAWS No. 13926 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.83 211 3.12 4.92 2.79
32. Nipple, Size 1/4" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 56.60 42.20 62.40 98.40 55.80
SAWS No. 13922 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.46 0.34 0.42 0.79 0.59
33. Nipple, Size 1/4" x Close Threaded TOTAL 23.00 17.00 21.00 39.50 29.50
SAWS No. 13893 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.43 0.32 0.84 0.73 0.56
34. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 21.50 16.00 42.00 36.50 28.00




F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 16-0395

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. 0. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 z = - - 5 o =
I ABULA I ION OF BIDS £ = 2 S RS 25
15} < s R 6 = R SgR sz
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for =59 ZEx Sgx 25K RS
FOR: Standard Galvanized Steel Pipe & Fittings g Dé E 25 295 5 i S o8
TIE & (October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017) Z s F 558 388§ £&8 g < x
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2016 SE5 a33< 52 < 2g< &g
=M AN c 59 < S d c 5N 'g
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY ; 3') = I 2 3 o g 3 = S 3 [&] ﬁ o
SAWS No. 13886 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.43 0.32 0.35 0.73 0.59
35. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 21.50 16.00 17.50 36.50 29.50
SAWS No. 13887 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 0.50 0.37 0.45 0.88 0.62
36. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 30.00 22.20 27.00 52.80 37.20
SAWS No. 13895 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.50 0.37 0.54 0.88 0.63
37. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 25.00 18.50 27.00 44.00 31.50
SAWS No. 13896 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 0.62 0.46 0.54 1.07 0.63
38. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 49.60 36.80 43.20 85.60 50.40
SAWS No. 13897 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.62 0.46 0.88 1.07 0.80
39. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 18.60 13.80 26.40 32.10 24.00
SAWS No. 13888 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.75 0.55 0.55 1.29 0.73
40. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 7.50 5.50 5.50 12.90 7.30
SAWS No. 13889 UNIT
25 ea. PRICE 0.75 0.55 0.73 1.29 0.99
41. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 18.75 13.75 18.25 32.25 24.75
SAWS No. 13890 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.85 0.63 0.79 1.47 0.99
42, Nipple, Size 1/2" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 25.50 18.90 23.70 44.10 29.70
SAWS No. 13898 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.85 0.63 0.93 1.47 1.16
43. Nipple, Size 1/2" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 42.50 31.50 46.50 73.50 58.00
SAWS No. 13894 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.00 1.49 221 3.87 2.19
44, Nipple, Size 1/2" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 20.00 14.90 22.10 38.70 21.90
SAWS No. 13899 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.41 0.30 0.34 0.71 0.50
45. Nipple, Size 1/2" x Close Threaded TOTAL 41.00 30.00 34.00 71.00 50.00
SAWS No. 14045 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.54 0.39 0.45 0.92 0.67
46. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 27.00 19.50 22.50 46.00 33.50
SAWS No. 14034 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.54 0.39 0.49 0.92 0.72
47. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 54.00 39.00 49.00 92.00 72.00
SAWS No. 14035 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.60 0.43 0.49 1.02 0.79
48. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 30.00 21.50 24.50 51.00 39.50
SAWS No. 14040 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.60 0.43 0.62 1.02 0.88
49. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 30.00 21.50 31.00 51.00 44.00
SAWS No. 14051 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.76 0.57 0.67 1.33 0.95
50. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 38.00 28.50 33.50 66.50 47.50
SAWS No. 14041 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.76 0.57 0.67 1.33 1.06
51. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 38.00 28.50 33.50 66.50 53.00
SAWS No. 14036 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.91 0.67 0.78 1.57 1.06
52. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 4550 33.50 39.00 78.50 53.00
SAWS No. 14037 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.91 0.67 0.86 157 1.29
53. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 18.20 13.40 17.20 31.40 25.80
SAWS No. 14038 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.08 0.82 0.91 1.90 1.45
54. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 21.60 16.40 18.20 38.00 29.00
SAWS No. 14042 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 1.08 0.82 0.92 1.90 145
55. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 54.00 41.00 46.00 95.00 72.50
SAWS No. 14033 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.36 1.75 1.99 4.09 2.63
56. Nipple, Size 3/4" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 47.20 35.00 39.80 81.80 52.60
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SAWS No. 14043 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.50 0.37 0.87 0.85 0.60
57. Nipple, Size 3/4" x Close Threaded TOTAL 50.00 37.00 87.00 85.00 60.00
SAWS No. 13861 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 0.79 0.59 0.75 1.37 1.01
58. Nipple, Size 1" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 23.70 17.70 22.50 41.10 30.30
SAWS No. 13862 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 0.86 0.64 0.75 1.49 1.10
59. Nipple, Size 1" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 51.60 38.40 45.00 89.40 66.00
SAWS No. 13876 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.86 0.64 0.79 1.49 1.23
60. Nipple, Size 1" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 8.60 6.40 7.90 14.90 12.30
SAWS No. 13863 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.03 0.77 1.14 1.78 1.23
61. Nipple, Size 1" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 20.60 15.40 22.80 35.60 24.60
SAWS No. 13869 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 1.03 0.77 1.14 178 1.43
62. Nipple, Size 1" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 61.80 46.20 68.40 106.80 85.80
SAWS No. 13864 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.26 0.95 1.40 2.19 1.62
63. Nipple, Size 1" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 25.20 19.00 28.00 43.80 32.40
SAWS No. 13865 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.26 0.95 1.40 2.19 173
64. Nipple, Size 1" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 25.20 19.00 28.00 43.80 34.60
SAWS No. 13866 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.43 1.08 1.40 2.49 1.92
65. Nipple, Size 1" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 14.30 10.80 14.00 24.90 19.20
SAWS No. 13991 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.43 1.08 1.91 2.49 2.10
66. Nipple, Size 1" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 14.30 10.80 19.10 24.90 21.00
SAWS No. 13867 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.40 178 191 4.65 2.75
67. Nipple, Size 1" x 8" Threaded TOTAL 24.00 17.80 19.10 46.50 27.50
SAWS No. 13870 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.73 2.04 1.99 5.31 3.19
68. Nipple, Size 1" x 10" Threaded TOTAL 54.60 40.80 39.80 106.20 63.80
SAWS No. 13883 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.67 0.50 0.58 117 0.91
69. Nipple, Size 1" x Close Threaded TOTAL 33.50 25.00 29.00 58.50 45.50
SAWS No. 13974 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.97 0.73 1.49 1.70 1.24
70. Nipple, Size 1-1/4" x 2" Threaded TOTAL 9.70 7.30 14.90 17.00 12.40
SAWS No. 13975 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.07 0.79 154 1.84 1.40
71. Nipple, Size 1-1/4" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 10.70 7.90 15.40 18.40 14.00
SAWS No. 13983 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.90 0.67 1.02 1.57 1.13
72. Nipple, Size 1-1/4" x Close Threaded TOTAL 9.00 6.70 10.20 15.70 11.30
SAWS No. 13949 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.26 0.95 1.34 2.19 174
73. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 12.60 9.50 13.40 21.90 17.40
SAWS No. 13972 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.26 0.95 1.34 2.19 1.97
74. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 12.60 9.50 13.40 21.90 19.70
SAWS No. 13950 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.60 1.20 1.34 2.78 2.19
75. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 16.00 12.00 13.40 27.80 21.90
SAWS No. 13958 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.60 1.20 2.13 2.78 2.43
76. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 32.00 24.00 42.60 55.60 48.60
SAWS No. 13951 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.93 1.43 213 3.63 2.69
77. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 19.30 14.30 21.30 36.30 26.90
SAWS No. 13959 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.93 1.43 2.13 3.63 3.17
78. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 19.30 14.30 21.30 36.30 31.70
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SAWS No. 13952 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.16 1.62 2.13 3.77 3.17
79. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 21.60 16.20 21.30 37.70 31.70
SAWS No. 13953 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.16 1.62 2.86 3.77 4.41
80. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 21.60 16.20 28.60 37.70 44.10
SAWS No. 13956 UNIT
15 ea. PRICE 4.50 3.36 6.36 7.81 5.50
81. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 67.50 50.40 95.40 117.15 82.50
SAWS No. 13960 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 1.05 0.79 1.55 1.84 251
82. Nipple, Size 1-1/2" x Close Threaded TOTAL 52.50 39.50 77.50 92.00 125.50
SAWS No. 14004 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 1.66 1.63 156 2.90 213
83. Nipple, Size 2" x 2-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 16.60 16.30 15.60 29.00 21.30
SAWS No. 14023 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.66 1.25 2.33 2.90 2.43
84. Nipple, Size 2" x 3" Threaded TOTAL 33.20 25.00 46.60 58.00 48.60
SAWS No. 14007 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 2.03 1.51 2.33 3.53 2.74
85. Nipple, Size 2" x 3-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 40.60 30.20 46.60 70.60 54.80
SAWS No. 13994 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.03 151 233 353 3.09
86. Nipple, Size 2" x 4" Threaded TOTAL 20.30 15.10 23.30 35.30 30.90
SAWS No. 13995 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.60 1.93 2.45 452 3.40
87. Nipple, Size 2" x 4-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 26.00 19.30 24.50 45.20 34.00
SAWS No. 13996 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.60 1.93 2.62 452 3.73
88. Nipple, Size 2" x 5" Threaded TOTAL 26.00 19.30 26.20 45.20 37.30
SAWS No. 13997 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 3.02 2.25 2.62 5.24 3.73
89. Nipple, Size 2" x 5-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 90.60 67.50 78.60 157.20 111.90
SAWS No. 13998 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 3.02 225 2.74 5.24 4.37
90. Nipple, Size 2" x 6" Threaded TOTAL 90.60 67.50 82.20 157.20 131.10
SAWS No. 13999 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 4.91 3.67 5.12 8.55 5.56
91. Nipple, Size 2" x 8" Threaded TOTAL 49.10 36.70 51.20 85.50 55.60
SAWS No. 13992 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 5.76 4.29 5.12 10.00 6.57
92. Nipple, Size 2" x 10" Threaded TOTAL 57.60 42.90 51.20 100.00 65.70
SAWS No. 13993 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 6.61 4.92 6.68 11.47 7.63
93. Nipple, Size 2" x 12" Threaded TOTAL 66.10 49.20 66.80 114.70 76.30
SAWS No. 13859 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 2351 19.27 4271 40.79 34.06
94. Nipple, Size 2" x 48" Threaded TOTAL 1,175.50 963.50 2,135.50 2,039.50 1,703.00
SAWS No. 14013 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 1.49 111 1.26 2.58 1.83
95. Nipple, Size 2" x Close Threaded TOTAL 74.50 55.50 63.00 129.00 91.50
SAWS No. 14084 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 7.96 5.93 8.82 13.83 9.37
96. Nipple, Size 4" x Close Threaded TOTAL 79.60 59.30 88.20 138.30 93.70
TOTAL GROUP 9 TOTAL 4,080.15 3,134.65 5,147.05 7,132.85 5,340.25
GROUP 10(PLUG
SAWS No. 14987 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 0.62 0.55 0.15 0.13 0.73
1. Plug, Square Head, Size 1/8" Threaded TOTAL 6.20 5.50 1.50 1.30 7.30
SAWS No. 14986 UNIT
70 ea. PRICE 0.67 0.55 0.20 0.18 0.73
2. Plug, Square Head, Size 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 46.90 38.50 14.00 12.60 51.10
SAWS No. 14995 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.67 0.55 0.34 0.26 0.93
3. Plug, Square Head, Size 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 13.40 11.00 6.80 5.20 18.60

10
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SAWS No. 14985 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.84 0.70 0.78 0.45 1.17
4. Plug, Square Head, Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 84.00 70.00 78.00 45.00 117.00
SAWS No. 14994 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 0.84 0.70 1.42 2.09 0.95
5. Plug, Square Head, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 42.00 35.00 71.00 104.50 47.50
SAWS No. 14983 UNIT
100 ea. PRICE 0.92 0.70 1.95 2.09 1.27
6. Plug, Square Head, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 92.00 70.00 195.00 209.00 127.00
SAWS No. 14988 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.91 1.58 1.96 472 2.66
7. Plug, Square Head, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 38.20 31.60 39.20 94.40 53.20
SAWS No. 14990 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 243 2.00 3.22 5.86 3.37
8. Plug, Square Head, Size 2" Threaded TOTAL 194.40 160.00 257.60 468.80 269.60
TOTAL GROUP 10 TOTAL 517.10 421.60 663.10 940.80 691.30
GROUP 11|TEE
SAWS No. 16583 UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 1.14 0.95 1.15 2.86 1.24
1. Tee, Size 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 34.20 28.50 34,50 85.80 37.20
SAWS No. 16550 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 1.14 0.95 1.15 2.86 1.24
2. Tee, Size 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 57.00 47,50 57.50 143.00 62.00
SAWS No. 16549 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 0.70 0.58 1.72 1.82 0.97
3. Tee, Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 14.00 11.60 34.40 36.40 19.40
SAWS No. 16575 UNIT
80 ea. PRICE 1.18 0.97 1.75 3.01 1.63
4. Tee, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 94.40 77.60 140.00 240.80 130.40
SAWS No. 16535 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 2.29 1.88 2.00 5.88 3.17
5. Tee, Size 1 x 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 22.90 18.80 20.00 58.80 31.70
SAWS No. 16560 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 1.93 1.59 1.95 4.87 2.67
6. Tee, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 38.60 31.80 39.00 97.40 53.40
SAWS No. 16558 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 3.05 2.51 3.71 7.73 3.59
7. Tee, Size 1-1/4", Threaded TOTAL 30.50 25.10 37.10 77.30 35.90
SAWS No. 16555 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 3.81 3.14 3.85 9.61 471
8. Tee, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 38.10 31.40 38.50 96.10 47.10
SAWS No. 16564 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 6.39 5.26 18.71 16.16 8.84
9. Tee, Size 2" x 1" Threaded TOTAL 63.90 52.60 187.10 161.60 88.40
SAWS No. 16565 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 6.36 5.24 6.42 15.62 8.84
10. Tee, Size 2" Threaded TOTAL 127.20 104.80 128.40 312.40 176.80
TOTAL GROUP 11 TOTAL 520.80 429.70 716.50 1,309.60 682.30
GROUP 12 (UNION
SAWS No. 16969 UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 4.08 3.36 4.19 12.09 4.41
1. Union, Size 1/8" Threaded TOTAL 40.80 33.60 41.90 120.90 44.10
SAWS No. 16992 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 2.62 2.16 3.98 7.12 2.84
2. Union, Size 3/8" Threaded TOTAL 131.00 108.00 199.00 356.00 142.00
SAWS No. 16967 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 3.94 3.24 3.98 10.65 4.27
3. Union, Size 1/4" Threaded TOTAL 78.80 64.80 79.60 213.00 85.40
SAWS No. 16962 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 2.65 2.18 6.13 6.50 3.67
4. Union, Size 1/2" Threaded TOTAL 159.00 130.80 367.80 390.00 220.20
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. 0. BOX 2449 =
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 g = - - 5 o -
I ABULA I ION OF BIDS £ = 2 S RS 25
8 g 4 ® o5 R Sgr e
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for 259 ZEx Sgx 25y RS
FOR: Standard Galvanized Steel Pipe & Fittings s Dé > 25 295 539 o8
TIME & (October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017) -4 558 389 £&8 g < x
mn < > I = 0 = 1] < T
DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2016 S o8 » & < go< £ &< xe g
=M AN c 59 < S d c 5N 'g
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY ; (7') = T 2 8 24 g 3 = S 3 [&] N 5]
SAWS No. 16988 UNIT
60 ea. PRICE 3.15 259 3.18 7.47 4.36
5. Union, Size 3/4" Threaded TOTAL 189.00 155.40 190.80 448.20 261.60
SAWS No. 16955 UNIT
50 ea. PRICE 3.91 3.22 9.80 9.78 5.41
6. Union, Size 1" Threaded TOTAL 195.50 161.00 490.00 489.00 270.50
SAWS No. 16974 UNIT
200 ea. PRICE 5.32 4.38 13.32 14.14 7.36
7. Union, Size 1-1/4", Threaded TOTAL 1,064.00 876.00 2,664.00 2,828.00 1,472.00
SAWS No. 16971 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 6.81 5.61 13.47 17.14 9.43
8. Union, Size 1-1/2" Threaded TOTAL 136.20 112.20 269.40 342.80 188.60
SAWS No. 16979 UNIT
20 ea. PRICE 9.09 7.49 19.73 19.70 12.59
9. Union, Size 2", Threaded TOTAL 181.80 149.80 394.60 394.00 251.80
TOTAL GROUP 12 TOTAL 2,176.10 1,791.60 4,697.10 5,581.90 2,936.20
TOTAL GROUPS 1 THRU 12 TOTAL 23,575.65 24,807.35 26,413.05 58,793.07 18,051.75
Additional sizes and items can be purchased as listed below:
Matco
Manufacturer Smith-Cooper Norca Anvil
Price Sheet MI0514 PL-1016-XHF PF.M1-616
Date Sept. 30, 2017 10/1/16 8/15/16
Discount 93% 15% List
Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Deliver Days 10-14 days 10-14 days 7 days 15 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alltex Supply Hughes Supply SAWS Website
Ameri Pipe KLP Commercial Demandstar
Cohen Pipe Moore Supply
Corix Morrison
Ferguson Romar Supply
Fortiline Techline Pipe
HD Supply Williams Supply
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